BRIGHTON & HOVE CITY COUNCIL.
ROAD TRAFFIC REGULATION ACT 1984

BRIGHTON & HOVE VARIOUS CONTROLLED PARKING ZONES
CONSOLIDATION ORDER 2008 AMENDMENT ORDER No.10 2011

Brighton & Hove City Council in exercise of its powers under Sections |, 2, 3, 4, 19, 32,
35, 35A, 43, 44, 45, 46, 46A, 47, 49, 51, 53, 55, 61, 63, 63A, 66, 1 17 and 124 (1) (c) & (d)
to the Road Traffic Regulation Act 1984 (“the 1984 Act”) as amended and Part 6 of the
Traffic Management Act 2004 and of all other enabling powers after consultation with the
Chief Officer of Police in accordance with Part Il of Schedule 9 to thel 984 Act hereby

makes the above named Order.

The provisions of this Order will come into operation on the ﬁﬁay of Novemgeg 201}
and amend the Brighton & Hove Various Controlled Parking Zones Consolidation Order
2008 as amended as follows:

ARTICLE AMENDMENTS:

PART 10 — INDEX OF SCHEDULE |

Part 2 No Loading/Unloading
Part 2.6 No Loading Monday to Saturday %am to 6pm:
Add the letter “C"” in the column headed “CPZ’s”

Part 2.14 No Loading Monday to Saturday 8am-9.30am and 4pm-6pm:
Add the letter "Y" in the column headed “CPZ’s"

Part 12 Loading Bays
Part 12.11 Loading Only Monday to Sunday 9am to 6pm:
Add the letters “R & W" in the column headed “CPZ’s”

SCHEDULE | AMENDMENTS:

Controlled Parking Zone C
Part 2.1 No Loading at any time
New item 17a: St George's Road — South side — From the western kerbline of Burlington

Street westwards and southwards for 50 metres

After existing Part 2.1 insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part 2.6 No Loading Monday to Saturday 9am to épm

Item

No Street Name | Side Description CPZ
From the northern kerbline of Marine
| Cameliford Both Parade northwards to the northern c
Street boundary of property No.32 Camelford
Street.




Part 5.1 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Short Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 2 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between 9am and 8pm inciusive

Delete item 7: North Drive, Brighton

Delete item |3:West Drive, Brighton
Delete item [4: West Drive, Brighton

Part 5.4 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay and Display
parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, with no return within 4 hours) from
Monday to Sunday between 9am to 3pm inclusive

Delete item 5: Freshfield Place, Brighton

Delete item 6: Freshfield Place, Brighton

Add new item 7a: North Drive — South side — From a point 8 metres east of the
prolongation of the western kerbline of Tower Road eastwards to a point 6 metres east
of the prolongation of the eastern kerbline of Tower Road

Delete item 8: Park Hill, Brighton

Add new item |3: West Drive — South side — From a point é metres east of a
prolongation of the eastern kerbline of the Private Road (adjacent to |-18 Park View)
eastwards for a distance of 24 metres

Add new item 14: West Drive - South east side- From a point opposite the northern
property boundary of No.!7 West Drive north eastwards to a point 4 metres north of a
point opposite the northern property boundary of No.19 West Drive

Part 5.7 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Long Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period up to 11 hours) from Monday to Sunday between 9am
and 8pm inclusive

Add new item |3a: South Avenue — North side — From a point 33 metres west of the
western kerbline of Freshfield Road westwards for a distance of 10 metres

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Amend item |6 Freshfield Place: delete “Whole description” and substitute * North side -
From a point 78 metres west of the western kerbline of Freshfield Road westwards for a
distance of 6.6 metres (outside MNo.18)"

Add new item 21b: ivory Place — East side - From a point 6.6 metres south of the
southern boundary of No.6 Ivory Place southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (o/s
No.4/5)

Add new item 39a: St James’s Street — North side — From a point 10.5 metres west of the
western kerbline of Dorset Gardens westwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside
No.23)

Part | 1.1 Motorcycie only at any time

Add new item 20a: Freshfield Road — East side — From a point 13 metres north of the
prolongation of the southern kerbline of Freshfield Place northwards for a distance of 8
metres



Add new item 5la: Sutherland Road —~ West side — From a point 5.5 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Evelyn Terrace southwards for a distance of 3 metres

Part 8.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permits

Amend item 57 Marine Gardens: insert “Excluding Nos. 18a, |8b |8c & 18d” in column
(3) Specific Properties and insert “Nos. 18a, |18b,18¢c & 18d (Car Free)" in column (4)
Comments

Amend item 91 St James's Street: insert “Excluding Flats | to 6 No.24A * in column (3}
Specific Properties and insert “Flats | to 6 No.24A (Car Free)” in column (4) Comments

Controlled Parking Zone H
Part 1.1 No Waiting At Any Time
Delete item 35: Kemp Town Place, Brighton

Delete item 52: St Mary’s Square, Brighton

Part 4.1 Permit parking only fromm Monday to Sunday between 9am - 8pm

inclusive
Amend item 108 Cowfold Road: delete “40.5 metres” and substitute “37.5 metres”

Amend item |38 Manor Road: delete 2] metres” and substitute “21.5 metres”

Part 5.4 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay & Display

parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between 9am-8pm inclusive

Amend item 6 Belgrave Place: delete “I5 metres” and substitute “14 metres” and delete

“36 metres” and substitute “43 metres”

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Add new item {9a: Chesham Road — North side- From the boundary wall between
Nos.[2 & |3 Chesham Road westwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside No.[3)

Delete item 40b: Madehurst Close, Brighton {outside No.|6)

Add new item 55a: Walpole Road — North side- From a point 43 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Walpole Terrace eastwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside
Hamliton Lodge School)

Delete item 58a: Arundel Road, Brighton {outside Arundel Lodge)

Renumber existing item 72a Manor Paddock as item 72b

Delete item 73a: Manor Road, Brighton (outside No.34)

Add new item 80b: Maresfield Road — East side — From a point 38 metres south of the

southern kerbline of Manor Hill southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (opposite
No.121)



Add new item B4b: Prince’s Terrace — East side — From a point 37 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Bristol Gardens northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside
No.46})

Add new item 85: Princes Terrace — West side from a point 32 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Bristol Road northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside No.4)

Part | 1.l Motorcycle only at any time
Add new item 4la: Cowfold Road — West side — From a point 42 metres south of the
southern boundary of property No.| | southwards for a distance of 3 metres

Delete item 46: Manor Road, Brighton

Add new item 46: Manor Road — West side — From a point 41.5 metres north of the
southern boundary of property No. 2| Manor Road, northwards for a distance of 3
metres

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permits
Amend item|5 Chapel Terrace: insert "Excluding No.|” in column (3) Specific Properties
and insert “No.| (Car Free)” in column (4) Comments

Amend item 28 College Road: insert “Excluding Basement Flat, Flats 1-3 No.7" in column
(3) Specific Properties and insert “Basement Flat, Flats 1-3 No.7 (Car Free}” in column (4)
Comments

Controlled Parking Zone }
Part |.| No Waiting At Any Time
Add new item 4a: Preston Park (Stanford Avenue Entrance) — South, west, north, and east

sides — From its junction with Stanford Avenue to the south eastern entrance to Preston
Park

Controlled Parking Zone M

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Add item 19b: Lansdowne Place - East side — From the southern boundary wall of No.92
lLansdowne Place northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside No.92)

Controlled Parking Zone N

Part .| No Waiting At Any Time

Amend item 48 Medina Place: delete “the whole description” and substitute “Entire
Length”

Amend item 50 Medina Place: delete “the whole description” and substitute “Entire
Length”

Amend item 51 Medina Place: delete “the whole description” and substitute “Entire
Length”

Part 1.4 No Waiting Monday to Saturday %9am to épm
Delete item 6: Medina Place

Add new item 6: Medina Place — East side — From a point 2 metres north of the northern
boundary of No.6 southwards for a distance of |0 metres



Delete item 7: Medina Place

Add new item 7: Medina Place — East side — From the southern boundary of property
No.4 southwards for a distance of 8.5 metres

Delete item 8: Medina Place

Add new item 8: Medina Place — East side — From a point 5.5 metres south of the
southern boundary of property No.2 southwards to the southern boundary of flats |-4

Delete item 9: Medina Place

Delete item 10: Medina Place

Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am - 8pm
inclusive

Add new item 8a: Connaught Road — North side — From a point 10 metres east of the

eastern kerbline of Sackville Road to a point I.| metre east of the party wall of Nos. 50
and 52 Stirling Place

Add new item 8b: Connaught Road — South side — From a peint | .3 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Sackville Road to a point 10.7 metres west of the western kerbline of

Connaught Road
Delete item 47: Medina Place

Add new item 47: Medina Place - East side — From the northern boundary of property
No.8 southwards for a distance of 9 metres

Delete item 48: Medina Place

Add new item 48: Medina Place — East side — From a point 1.5 metres north of the
northern boundary of property No.4 southwards for a distance of 6 metres

Delete item 49: Medina Place

Add new item 49: Medina Place — East side —~ From a point | metre north of the southern
boundary of property No.2 southwards for a distance of 6.5 metres

Delete itern 92: Vallance Gardens, Hove

Add new item 92: Vallance Gardens — East side — From a point 7.3 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Vallance Road southwards for a distance of 15.5 metres

Add new item 92a: Vallance Gardens — East side — From a point 29 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Vallance Road southwards for a distance of 19 metres

Add new item 92b: Vallance Gardens —~ East side — From a point 61.2 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Vallance Road southwards for a distance of 21.3 metres



Add new item 92c: Vallance Gardens — East side — From a point 92.2 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Vallance Road southwards for a distance of 7.9 metres

Add new item 92d: Vallance Gardens — East side — From a point 109 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Vallance Road southwards for a distance of 32.5 metres

Add new item 92e: Vallance Gardens — East side — From a point 146.7 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Vallance Road southwards for a distance of 9.7 metres

Add new item 92f: Vallance Gardens — East side — From a point 10.2 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 25.4 metres

Add new item 92g: Vallance Gardens — East side — From a point 44.1 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 5.7 metres

Add new item 92h: Vallance Gardens — East side — From a point 77.3 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 5.6 metres

Add new item 92i: Vallance Gardens — East side — From a point 92.4 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 13.5 metres

Add new item 92j: Vallance Gardens — East side — From a point 14.] metres north of the
northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of |11 metres

Part 5.1 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Short Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 2 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between 9am to 8pm

Delete item 3: Connaught Road, Hove

Delete item 4: Connaught Road, Hove

Part 5.7 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Long Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to |1 hours) from Monday to Sunday between $am
to 8pm inclusive

Amend item 7 Eaton Gardens: delete “16.] metres” and substitute "13 metres”

Part 5.11 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Long Term Pay & Display
Parking (for a period of up to 9 hours) from Monday to Friday between 9am &
6pm

Add new item 4a: Conway Street (east/west section) — North side — From a point 8
metres west of the turning head at the eatern end of Conway Street westwards for a
distance of 6 metres

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Delete item |7: Connaught Terrace (outside No.43)

Amend item 18 Conway Street: delete “6.6 metres” and substitute *13.2 metres”

Delete item 2|: Eaton Gardens, Hove (outside Eaton Manor)

Part |1 1.1 Motorcycle only at any time



Amend item 59 Salisbury Road: delete “2 metres" and substitute “6 metres”
Amend item 79 Vallance Gardens: delete “51.3 metres” and substitute “52.5 metres”
Amend item 80 Vallance Gardens: delete “8.8 metres” and substitute “7.6 metres”

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permits
Amend item | | Connaught Road: insert “Excluding Flats 1-3 No.25” in column (3) Specific
Properties and insert “Flats -3 No.25 (Car Free) in column (4) Comments

Amend item 46 Medina Villas: insert “Excluding Nos, 35, 36, 37 & 38" in column (3)
Specific Properties and insert “Nos. 35, 36, 37 & 38 (Car Free)

Controlled Parking Zone O
Part 5.5 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay & Display

parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Saturday between %am to 8pm inclusive
Delete item 9¢c: Davigdor Road, Brighton

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Add new item 7a: Cromwell Road — North side — From the eastern boundary wall of
No.24 Cromwell Road westwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside No.24)

Amend item 22 Osmond Road: delete “6.9 metres” and substitute *5.3 metres” and
delete “southern boundary of No.52 Osmond Road" and substitute “northern kerbline of
Colbourne Road”

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permits
Amend item 44 Wilbury Villas: insert “Excluding No.5 & No.7" in column (3) Specific
Properties and insert “No.5 & No.7 (Car Free)” in column (4) Comments

Controlled Parking Zone R
Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am and 8pm

inclusive
Delete item 50: Sackville Gardens, Hove

Add new item 50: Sackville Gardens — East side — From a point 106.3 metres south of the
southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of 9.3 metres

Add new item 50a: Sackville Gardens — East side — From a point 125.] metres south of the
southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of 13 metres

Add new item 50b: Sackville Gardens — East side — From a point 143.6 metres south of the
southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of 4.5 metres

Add new item 50c: Sackville Gardens — East side ~ From a point [54.6 metres south of the
southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of 11.5 metres

Add new item 50d: Sackville Gardens — East side — From a point 170 metres south of the
southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance |3 metres



Add new item 50e: Sackville Gardens — East side — From a point 189.2 metres south of the
southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of 2.7 metres

Add new item 50f: Sackville Gardens — East side — From a point 223.6 metres south of the
southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of { 1.9 metres

Add new item 50g: Sackville Gardens — East side — From a point 8 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 17.4 metres

Add new item 50h: Sackville Gardens — East side — From a point 49.4 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 11.7 metres

Add new item 50i: Sackville Gardens — East side — From a point 65.4 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 1 1.8 metres

Add new item 50j: Sackville Gardens — East side — From a point 86.2 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 9.6 metres

Add new item 50k: Sackville Gardens — East side — From a point 99.8 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 14 metres

Add new item 50I: Sackville Gardens — East side — From a point 119 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 9.3 metres

Add new item 50m: Sackville Gardens — East side — From a point 143.8 metres north of
the northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 16.6 metres

Part 5.4 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between 9am-8pm inclusive

Add new item 34a: Portland Road — South side — From a point 9.5 metres west of the
western kerbline of Hogarth Road westwards for a distance of 27 metres

Renumber existing item 46a Sackville Road as item 46¢

Add new item 46a: Sackville Gardens — East side — From a point |5.5 metres south of the
southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of 20.5 metres

Add new item 46b: Sackville Gardens — East side — From a point 44.3 metres south of the
southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of 58 metres

Delete item 65: Westbourne Villas, Hove

Add new item 65: Westbourne Villas — VWest side — From a point 3| metres south of the
southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of | |.6 metres

Add new item 65a: Westbourne Villas — West side — From a point 55.7 metres south of
the southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of 6.5 metres

Add new item 65b; Westbourne Villas — West side — From a point 72.2 metres south of
the southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of 13.6 metres



Add new item 6é5c: Westbourne Villas — West side — From a point 9.6 metres south of
the southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of 5.7 metres

Add new item 65d: Westbourne Villas — West side — From a point 106.9 metres south of
the southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of [ 1.5 metres

Add new item 65e: Westbourne Villas - West side — From a point [23.7 metres south of
the southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of 12.3 metres

Add new item 65f: Westbourne Villas — West side — From a point 139.7 metres south of
the southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of 6.9 metres

Add new item 65g: Westbourne Villas — West side — From a point |61.6 metres south of
the southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of 8.2 metres

Add new item 65h: Westbourne Villas — West side — From a point | 1.5 metres north of
the northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 16.2 metres

Add new item 65i: VWestbourne Villas — West side — From a point 46.2 metres north of
the northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of | 1.2 metres

Add new item 65: Westbourne Villas — West side — From a point 61.9 metres north of
the northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 30.4 metres

Add new item 65k: Westbourne Villas — West side ~ From a point 99.3 metres north of
the northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 8 metres

Add new item 651: Westbourne Villas — West side — From a point | 14.9 metres north of
the northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 10.9 metres

Add new item 65m: Westbourne Villas — West side — From a point 130.1 metres north of
the northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of |5 metres

Add new item &5n: Westbourne Villas — West side — From a point 150.4 metres north of
the northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 35 metres

Add new item 650: Westbourne Villas — West side — From a point [90.5 metres north of
the northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 8.2 metres

Add new item 65p: Westbourne Villas — West side — From a point 205.9 metres north of
the northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 11.5 metres

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Delete item 9a: Carlisle Road, Hove (outside No.27)

Add new item 22a: Langdale Road — West side — From a point 6 metres north of the
southern boundary of Property No.[0 Langdale Road northwards for a distance of 6
metres (outside Nos. 10/12)

Add new item 41: Montgomery Street — North side —~ From the prolongation of the
western boundary of property No.21 eastwards for a distance of 6 metres



Add new item 45a: Montgomery Street — North side — From the western boundary of

property No.6| Montgomery Street eastwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside
No.61)

Delete item 48: Payne Avenue, Hove (outside No.68)

Add new item 55a: Pembroke Crescent - North side — From a point 15 metres west of

the western kerbline of Sackville Road westwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (near to
No.l})

Delete item 61a: Poynter Road, Hove

Amend item 1042 Westbourne Villas: delete “41.5 metres” and substitute “42.6 metres”
Part 12.7 Loading Only Monday ~Saturday 9am to 6pm (for up to a period of
30 minutes, no return within | hour)

Delete item {: Portland Road, Hove

Delete item 2: Portland Road, Hove

Delete item 3: Portland Road, Hove

Delete item 4: Richardson Road, Hove

Delete item 5; Stoneham Road, Hove

After existing Part 12.7 insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part 12.11 Loading Only Monday to Sunday 9am to 6pm

Item

No Street Name | Side Description CPZ

From a point 26 metres east of the
prolongation of the eastern kerbline of
Woestbourne Street east for a distance of |7
metres.

] Portland Road North

From a point 6.3 metres east of the eastern
2 Portland Road South | kerbline of Titian Road east for a distance of R
}5 metres

From a point 4 metres east of the
prolongation of the eastern kerbline of
Ruskin Road eastwards for a distance of 10
metres

3 Stoneham Road | South

Controlled Parking Zone W
Part |.1 No Waiting At Any Time

Delete and reinstate item 7: Kingsway
Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Add new item 1: Berriedale Avenue — East side — From the boundary wall between Nos.
57 & 59 Berriedale Avenue southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside No.57)

10



After existing Part | 1.] insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part [2.11 Loading Only Monday to Sunday 9am to 6pm

::zm Street Name | Side Description CPZ
From a point 1.7 metres south of the
| Richardson East prolongation of the northern boundary of W
Road property No.I3 south for a distance of 10
metres

Controllied Parking Zone Y
Part I.1 No Waiting At Any Time

Delete and reinstate item 7: Belmont Street

Amend item 52 London Road: delete “Whole length” and substitute “From St Peter’s
Place to Preston Circus”

Part |.4 No Waiting Monday to Saturday 9am to 6pm
Amend item 29 Victoria Road, Brighton: delete *7 metres” and a substitute “8 metres”

and delete 17 metres” and substitute “17.5 metres”

Amend item 30 Victoria Road, Brighton: delete “the whole description” and substitute
“South side — From a point 35.5 metres east of the eastern kerbline of Montpelier Villas
eastwards for a distance of [0 metres

Part 2.1 No Loading at any time

Add new item %a: Junction Road — North and East side — From the western kerbline of
Queen's Road westwards and northwards for 2| metres

Delete and reinstate item 22: Queens Road

Delete and reinstate item 23: Queens Road

Delete, reinstate and amend item 24 Queens Road: delete *19 metres” and substitute
“20.9 metres”

Delete, reinstate and amend item 25 Queens Road: delete “75 metres” and substitute *60
metres”

Delete, reinstate and amend item 26 Queens Road: delete the whole description and
substitute “West side — From the northern kerbline of Junction Road northwards to the

boundary with Brighton Station a distance of 25.5 metres

Add new item 38c: Trafalgar Street — North side — From the western kerbline of York
Place westwards for a distance of 15 metres

Add new item 38d: Trafalgar Street — South side ~ From the western kerbline of St
George’s Place westwards for a distance of [5 metres

Part 2.7 No Loading Monday to Saturday 8-9.30am, 12-2pm, 4.30-6pm
Delete and reinstate item [; Queens Road

Delete and reinstate item 2: Queens Road

11



Delete and reinstate item 3: Queens Road

Part 2.9 No Loading Monday to Saturday 8am - 9.30am and 4.30pm - épm
Delete item 7: Junction Road, Brighton

Part 2.11 No Loading Monday to Saturday 4pm-6pm

Amend item 2 Ditchling Road: delete “the whole description” and substitute “VVest side -
From the southern kerbline of Francis Street southwards to the northern kerbline of
Oxford Street.

After existing Part 2.12 insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part 2.14 No Loading Monday to Saturday 8am- 9.30am and 4pm — 6pm

Item

No Street Name | Side Description CPZ

From the eastern kerbline of Surrey Street
I Junction Road South | eastwards to the western kerbline of Y
Queens Road.

Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am - 8pm
Amend item 52 Clifton Road: delete “Whole Description™ and substitute “South side —
From a point 8 metres north of the northern kerbline of Clifton Hill northwards for a
distance of 12.8 metres

Add new item 52a: Clifton Road ~ South side — From a point 28.3 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Clifton Hiil northwards for a distance of 83.5 metres

Add new item 52b: Clifton Road — South side — From a point |4 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Dyke Road southwards for a distance of 18 metres

Part 5.12 Shared Permit Holders and Medium Tariff Short Term Pay &
Display parking (for a period of up to 2 hours, no return within 4 hours) from
Monday to Sunday between 9am to 8 pm

Delete, reinstate and amend item 3: Belmont Street delete |5 metres” and substitute *13
metres”

Part 7.1 Doctors Parking At Any Time
Delete item 3: Victoria Road, Brighton

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Add new item 50: Windlesham Road — West side — From a point 39 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Temple Gardens northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside
Windlesham House)

Part | |.] Motorcycle only at any time

Amend item 8 Clifton Road: delete “Whole description” and substitute “South side —
From a point 32 metres south of the southern kerbline of Dyke Road southwards for a
distance of 5.5 metres”

Part 2.1 Loading Only At Any Time
Delete item 2: Ditchling Road, Brighton

12



Delete item 5: Gloucester Road, Brighton
Delete item | 1: North Road, Brighton

Part 12.11 Loading Only Monday to Sunday 9am to 6pm
Renumber existing item | Guildford Road as item 3

Add new item |: Ditchling Road ~ West side ~ From a point 20 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Oxford Street southwards for |7 metres

Add new item 2: Gloucester Road — Both sides — From a point adjacent to the eastern
property boundary of No.26 Gloucester Road westwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item 4: North Road - South side — From a pdint 3 metres west of the western
property boundary of No.44 North Road westwards for a distance of |9 metres

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permits
Amend item 2 Alexandra Villas: insert “Excluding Flats | -7 No.22" in column (3) Specific
Properties and insert “Flats 1-7 No.22 (Car Free) in column (4) Comments

Amend item 61 Kensington Street: insert “Argus Lofts (car free)” in column (4).

Amend item 68 London Road: insert “From St Peters Place to Preston Circus only &
Excluding Flats 1-5 No.17" in column (3) Specific Properties and insert “Flats 1-5 No.|7
(Car Free)" in column (4) Comments

Amend item 99 Robert Street: insert “Argus Lofts (car free)” in column 4.

Controlled Parking Zone Z
Part 1.1 No Waiting At Any Time

Amend item 24 Dyke Road: delete “Church Road" and substitute “Church Street”

Part 1.4 No Waiting Monday to Saturday 9am to 6pm

Amend item 20 Spring Street: delete the whole description and substitute “ East side —
From a point |6 metres north of the northern kerbline of Western Road northwards for
a distance of 44 metres

Part 2.7 No Loading Monday to Saturday 8-9.30am, 12-2pm, 4.30-6pm
Delete and reinstate item |: Queens Road

Delete and reinstate item 2: Queens Road

Part 2.10 No Loading Monday to Saturday 8am — 9.30am
Delete and reinstate itern 1; Queens Road

Delete and reinstate item 2: Queens Road

Part 4.1 Permit Parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am - 8pm

inclusive
Amend item 8 Bedford Square: delete “West side” and substitute “East side” delete “I

13



metre south” and substitute “4 metres north”

Amend item 101 Spring Street: delete the whole description and substitute * East side —
From a point 4 metres south of the southern kerbline of Upper North Street southwards
for a distance of 54 metres”

Amend item |06 Upper North Street: delete “3 metres” and substitute "6 metres” and
delete “24 metres” and substitute “21 metres”

Part 5.12 Shared Permit Holders and Medium Tariff Short Term Pay &Display
parking (for a period of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between 9am to 8pm

Add new item la: Bedford Place — East side — From a point 16.8 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Western Road southwards to a point | metre north of the southern
property boundary of No.2{a Bedford Place.

Part 5.18 Shared Permit Holders and High Tariff Short Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 2 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between 9am to 8pm

Amend item |7 Spring Street: delete the whole description and substitute “VVest side —
From a point 9 metres south of the southern kerbline of Upper North Street southwards
for a distance of 22 metres”

Delete the existing unnumbered item for Spring Street

Add new item |7a: Spring Street — West side — From a point 3 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Hampton Street northwards for a distance of 26.5 metres.

Add new item | 7b: Spring Street — East side — From a point 58 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Upper North Street southwards for a distance of 2.5 metres.

Part 6.2 Exclusive Medium Tariff Short Term Pay & Display parking (for a
period of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday to Sunday
between 9am to 6pm

Delete item |: Bedford Place, Brighton

Delete item 2: Borough Street, Brighton

Add new item 2: Borough Street — West side — From a point 6 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Western Road northwards for a distance of 25 metres

Delete item 3: Borough Street, Brighton
Amend item 5 Norfolk Square: insert “(of western carriageway)"” after “west side”

Amend item 6 Norfolk Square: insert “(of western carriageway)” after “east side”

Part 9.2 Disabled Badge Holders Parking Monday to Sunday 9am to épm

14



Amend item [2 Spring Street: delete the whole description and substitute “East side —
From a point 10.5 metres north of the northern kerbline of Western Road northwards
for a distance of 5.5 metres

Amend item |3 Spring Street: delete the whole description and substitute “West side —
From a point 10.5 metres north of the northern kerbline of Western Road northwards
for a distance of 5.5 metres

Part [ I.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time

Amend item 29 Spring Street: delete the whole description and substitute “East side —
From a point 7 metres north of the northern kerbline of Western Road northwards for a
distance of 3.5 metres

Amend item 30 Spring Street: delete the whole description and substitute “VWest side
from a point 7.5 metres north of the northern kerbline of Western Road northwards for
a distance of 3 metres

Add new item 33: Upper North Street -~ North side — From a point 3 metres east of the
property boundary of Nos. 70 & 71 eastwards for a distance of 3 metres

Part | 2.1 Loading only At Any Time
Delete itern 33: Ship Street, Brighton

Part 12.11 Loading Only Monday to Sunday %am to é6pm
Add new item 6: Ship Street — West side — From a point |0 metres north of the northern
property boundary of No.2 Ship Street northwards for a distance of |9 metres

13.1 Taxi Rank At Any Time
Amend item | East Street: delete “35.5 metres” and substitute 18 metres”

Add new item la: East Street — East side — From a point 37.3 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Castle Square southwards for a distance of 10.7 metres

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permits

Amend item 27 Castle Street: Insert “Excluding Apartments |-7 No.24 & No.24a” in
column (3) Specific Properties and insert “Apartments -7 No.24 & No.24a (Car Free)” in
column (4) Comments

Amend item 65 Market Street: Insert “Excluding Flats [-9 Princess Gates No.57" in
column (3) Specific Properties and insert “Flats 1-9 Princess Gates No.57 (Car Free)" in

column (4) Comments

Amend item 106 Regency Mews: insert “Excluding No.2a” in column (3) Specific
Properties and insert “No.2a (Car Free)"” in column (4) Comments

15



THE COMMON SEAL OF BRIGHTON & HOVE )
CITY COUNCIL was affixed hereto this 25t "day of )
Oetober Two Thousand and £y EN )
in the presence of

Authorised Persen

16



